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Ms M Comber
Broxhead Commoners Association Culture, Communities and Business Services
The Old Cottage Mottisfont Court, High Street
Bordon Winchester, Hampshire SO23 8ZF
GU35 0QS ) Telephone 01962 841841
m.comber@btinternet.com Fax 01962 841565
www.hants.gov.uk
Enquiries to Tara Pothecary My reference FOI - 4224
Direct Line 01962 847096 Your reference
Date 12 December 2011 E-mail ccbs.foi@hants.gov.uk

Dear Ms Comber

Re your recent request for information around Broxhead Common. Your request has been
considered under the Environmental Information regulations act (2004). EIR. EIR is broadly
similar to the Freedom of Information Act, but applies to environmental information.

1. A copy of the pre-registration of title deeds plus any application for change of use or
extinguishment for the whole or part of the 180 acres

Hampshire County Council does not hold title deeds as we are not the land owners.

We have no record of current planning applications for change of use within this area.
However we only deal with planning applications for minerals, waste and County Council
developments, any other planning application would be dealt with by East Hampshire
District Council. There were no records found with reference to the extinguishment for the
whole or part of the 180 acres.

2. A copy of the Commons Owners Register and any Deeds of entitlement
I enclose copies of the Commons Register showing the land to which you refer and the

Ordnance Survey detailing the land, please note that they are not to scale, having been
reduced to A3 size.
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For further details of deeds of entitlement you would need to contact the land registry as we
do not hold this information. (I have attached a link for your reference).
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3. A copy of the final determination Notice from the Chief Commons Commissioner 1978

Please see attached.

w O W

SCAN-rdhpsf2bw_( SCAN-pIxn2cdsw_( SCAN-w1sz4td7n_(
HF000002407576...HF000002407443...HF000002407422...

4. The application for and consent from the Secretary of State for the fenced 80 acres

Hampshire County Council have checked their records and have found nothing recorded for
the application for and consent from the Secretary of State for the fenced 80 acres.

Yours sincerely

RSO0\

Tara Pothecary
FOI/EIR Co-ordinator for
Culture, Communities and Business Services

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal
review. Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of receipt of the
response to your original letter and should be addressed to Head of Information Compliance, Chief
Executive's Department, The Castle, Winchester, SO23 8UJ or emailed to foi@hants.gov.uk.

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply directly to
the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.



